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North Star All Stars - Fairbanks
   
North Star All Stars: The Ultimate Gymnastics Center for Children in
Fairbanks, Alaska

  If you're looking for a fantastic venue that is not only a gymnastics center but
also an exciting place for children's parties, look no further than North Star All
Stars. Situated in Fairbanks, Alaska, this center offers a variety of fun activities
that cater to high-energy kids.  

Perfect for Birthday Parties
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  Many parents have shared their positive experiences when celebrating
birthdays at North Star All Stars. One parent noted, "We had my daughter's 4th
birthday party here. It was fantastic! Great for high energy kids." The facility
features a wide range of options for play, including a ball pit, bouncy house,
trampoline, and tumbling equipment that keeps children entertained for hours.  

Accessibility Features

  A major highlight of North Star All Stars is its wheelchair-accessible car park,
making it a welcoming environment for everyone. The commitment to
accessibility ensures that all families can enjoy the facilities without any
limitations.  

Great for Kids of All Ages

  Parents love how North Star All Stars is particularly suited for younger children,
with many commenting that it is “great for all kids but particularly younger ones
(2 to 6)”. Clean, safe, and easy to work with, this gymnastics center focuses on
providing a friendly atmosphere where children can explore and have fun.  

A Family-Friendly Environment

  The coaches and staff at North Star All Stars are dedicated to creating a
supportive community. One enthusiastic parent mentioned, “We love our
coaches and the NSAS family!” This sense of belonging makes it an ideal place
for kids to flourish, whether they are engaged in gymnastics or cheerleading.   

Easy Party Planning

  Planning a party at North Star All Stars is a breeze. As one parent described,
“There is a full room in the back to use with tables and a fridge as well as tons of
counter space.” With plenty of time allocated for decorating and cleanup, hosts
can focus on celebrating while the staff takes care of the rest, including
sanitizing the equipment after the fun.  

Conclusion

  Overall, North Star All Stars stands out as an excellent choice for children's
activities and birthday parties in Fairbanks, Alaska. With its range of facilities,
accessibility features, and a family-oriented environment, it’s no wonder that so
many families recommend this gymnastics center for fun and memorable
experiences!    
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You will find us at

  
 391 Old Richardson Hwy, 99701  Fairbanks, Alaska - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of the respective Gymnastics center  is +1907-750-4725
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1907-750-4725
 
    
 
   
    
 

Visit us during the following hours:

    Day Hours    Monday 9–11?AM   Tuesday 11?AM–12?PM   Wednesday 5–9?PM   Thursday 5–9?PM   Friday 5–9?PM   Saturday 5–9?PM   Sunday 5–9?PM        The website is North Star All Stars       In case you want to adjust any data that you feel is not accurate about this
site, we ask send us a message and we will handle it as soon as possible. In
advance thanks. 

Images
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=64.8188242%2C-147.6958909#map=15/64.8188242/-147.6958909
tel:+1907-750-4725
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http://www.northstarallstars.com/


North star all stars map

North star all stars fairbanks
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