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First State Baptist Church - Wilmington
   
Welcome to First State Baptist Church: A Community of Faith in
Wilmington, Delaware

  First State Baptist Church, located in Wilmington, Delaware, stands as a
beacon of hope and community for those seeking a welcoming place of worship.
Known for its **friendly congregation** and doctrinal integrity, this church offers
an enriching experience for both visitors and regular attendees.  

Accessibility Features at First State Baptist Church

  One of the standout features of First State Baptist Church is its commitment to
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**accessibility**. The church understands the importance of making its facilities
welcoming for everyone.   - **Wheelchair-accessible car park**: The convenient
parking ensures that those with mobility challenges can easily access the
church premises without any hassle.  - **Wheelchair-accessible entrance**:
Visitors can enter the church with ease, allowing for a smooth transition into a
space designed for worship and fellowship.  

A Warm and Inviting Atmosphere

  Upon entering First State Baptist Church, newcomers are often struck by the
**warmth and friendliness** of the congregation. Many visitors have shared their
experiences highlighting the genuine welcome they received:  - "I attended as a
visitor today. The congregation was friendly, and I love that they are
KJV-focused with NO praise and worship music." This sentiment captures the
essence of the church’s environment—a place where biblical teaching is
prioritized.  - Regular attendees like one couple mentioned, "My wife and I have
been going here for several weeks now and we really enjoy it." Their
appreciation for the community spirit underlines the church's mission to foster
connections among members.  

Biblical Preaching: An In-Depth Experience

  At First State Baptist Church, preaching is not only a routine; it is an **in-depth
experience** laden with spiritual nourishment.   - “I appreciate the in-depth
inspired preaching and teaching,” expressed one visitor, emphasizing how the
messages are both engaging and enlightening.   - With sermons recorded and
made available on platforms like sermon audio and YouTube, those unable to
attend in person can still benefit from the teachings.  

Recharge Your Spirit

  For many, First State Baptist Church serves as a sanctuary to **recharge the
weary heart and soul**. Visitors have noted the impact of the sermons delivered
by Pastor Knickerbocker, who is recognized for his gospel knowledge and
passionate delivery.  - "Wow! This young preacher is full of gospel knowledge,"
remarked one attendee, reflecting on the revitalizing effect the sermons have on
congregants.  

Community Engagement and Solid Doctrine

  First State Baptist Church is not only focused on internal growth but also aims
to reach out to the community. They embody a mission of love and service,
ensuring that the solid doctrine preached within the church extends into
real-world applications.  - "Great friendly people. Solid doctrine. Reaching out to
the community with love," one member concluded, highlighting the church's
commitment to its larger mission.  

Join Us at First State Baptist Church
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  If you are looking for a church that combines **accessibility**, a friendly
atmosphere, impactful preaching, and a heart for community service, First State
Baptist Church in Wilmington, Delaware, invites you to join them. With a
welcoming spirit and a commitment to biblical teaching, it promises a fulfilling
worship experience. Visit us and discover why so many people have found their
spiritual home here.    
Our address is

  
 4800 Lancaster Pike, 19807  Wilmington, Delaware - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The phone number of the mentioned Baptist church  is +1302-222-8329
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1302-222-8329
 
    
 
   
    
 

We are available at these times:

    Day Hours    Monday Open 24 hours   Tuesday Open 24 hours   Wednesday Open 24 hours   Thursday Open 24 hours   Friday Open 24 hours   Saturday Open 24 hours   Sunday Open 24 hours        The website is First State Baptist Church       If you require to adjust any data that you consider is not precise concerning
this portal, we ask send a message so we can we will adjust it quickly. With
anticipation thank you very much. 

Images
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